Hammond Northshore Airport (HDC) Construct Airport Traffic Control Tower
Hammond, Louisiana

Project: RFP 13-27
BID RESULTS Opened May 23, 2013, 2:00PM CST
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Bidder Base Bid Add Alt 1 Add Alt 2 Add Alt 3 Piling Length Dynamic Restrike Beacon Generator
Preprinted Companies on Bidders List Lvl 4 + Elevator Sign + Canopy Lvl 2 and 3 1 foot 1 each Lump Lump
1 Brunt Construction,Inc Y Y Y Y Y Y S 1,813,000.00 S 97,000.00 S 28,300.00 13,000.00 70.00 S 3,000.00  $ 6,000.00 S 8,000.00
2 Cobalt Construction No Bid
3 Frank Anzalone Associates No Bid
4 Gibbs Construction Y Y Y Y Y Y S 2,070,000.00 S 145,000.00 S 38,000.00 30,000.00 60.00 S 4,500.00 S 6,000.00 S 7,500.00
5 J.W.Grand,Inc No Bid
6 Omega General Construction No Bid
7 M&R Electric No Bid
8 Professional Construction Services No Bid
9 Spartan Building Corporation Y Y Y Y Y Y S 1,778,000.00 S 183,000.00 S 32,000.00 32,000.00 70.00 S 7,000.00 S 11,000.00 S 8,500.00
10 | Wainwright Construction No Bid
Engineer's Estimate of Probable Construction Cost $ 1,243,050.00 S 103,156.00 S 14,000.00 S 37,510.00
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