BID SUMMARY

HAMMOND NORTHSHORE REGIONAL AIRPORT PHASE II DRAINAGE
IMPROVEMENTS FOR THE CITY OF HAMMOND

Bid Opening: Thursday, October 30, 2014, 10:00 a.m.

BIDDER Louisiana Contractor| BASE BID Bid
License Number Items "1-17" Rank
" 15210 Anme Lane, Houston, T 77064 45905 |S suaes0 | 7
i gof?;viiﬁelﬁf Dﬁigjilg;g,cLA 70068 12702 NO BID
> ﬁzgﬁfnfhzf: 'ﬁﬂiﬁéﬁﬁd Westwego, LA 70094 1033 NO BID
* ?;rilﬁligyy:g:ﬁ?g;:h;LfA 70123 4674 $ 44161850 | 3
i ﬂ'fséﬁiliﬂiflﬁﬁff llzlcl;ge, LA 70895 5693 $ 577,785.69 | 5
> ?;591;;fgg?;oiezgzgiz,glésﬁezgrgeld, MO 63005 26836 NO BID
" D15 Manton Drive. Covinton, L 70433 935 |5 38650000 | 1
b 0. B 1313, Hammand. LA 70404 39990 |s 43470000 | 2
311 Acom Lane, Pieayane, 113 39466 47581 NO BID
> ;251;1(1)3reiV;E:reSCozfcl}:lzgét:c;l,g])(;gﬁa;LS(;rings, LA 70726 14807 $ 695,950.00 6
. %zgcﬁfi;hl:viy 59, Abita Springs, LA 70420 16724 $ 508870.00 | 4
A8 Highay 190, Repert LA 70455 12198 NO BID
NOTES TO BID OPENING:

(1) A & A Cable Contractors, Inc. - extension for Bid Item 2 was incorrect.

Certified Correct: M g f/}ﬂ:f;:

Klley F/ Bates, P. E.

/

Page 1

Date: October 30, 2014




Bid Opening: Thursday, October 30, 2014, 10:00 a.m.

BID TABULATION
HAMMOND NORTHSHORE REGIONAL AIRPORT PHASE II DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS FOR THE CITY OF HAMMOND

Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC, Consulting Civil Engineers

A & A Cable Contractors, | Durr Heavy Construction,
Bid Engineer's Estimate Inc. LLC Industrial Enterprises, Inc.
Item Description Bid Quantity| UnitPrice | Extension | UnitPrice | Extension | UnitPrice | Extension | UnitPrice | Extension

1.|Mobilization 1 |EA $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 ] $47,500.00 | $47,500.00] $33,380.05| $33,380.05] $ 45,425.00 | $45,425.00
2.|Haul-in/compact earthen backfill - vehicular measure 250 |CY 12.00 3,000.00 61.25 15,312.50 18.90 4,725.00 17.83 4,457.50
3.|Install flowable fill in pipe voids as directed (truck measure) 250 [CY 125.00 31,250.00 162.00 40,500.00 140.20 35,050.00 154.79 38,697.50
4.[Pipe Cleaning (24" - 36" diameter storm drain pipes) 1,200 [LF 20.00 24,000.00 25.00 30,000.00 7.75 9,300.00 5.75 6,900.00
5.|Clean/access existing catch basin 2 |EA 250.00 500.00 2,500.00 5,000.00 367.45 734.90 120.75 241.50
6.|Post CIPP Video storm drain pipes (all sizes) 1,200 |LF 10.00 12,000.00 5.00 6,000.00 1.20 1,440.00 1.15 1,380.00
7.|Install CIPP Lining (existing 24" pipe) 1,100 |LF 150.00 | 165,000.00 171.00 188,100.00 118.80| 130,680.00 109.25 | 120,175.00
8.|Install CIPP Lining (existing 30" pipe) 100 |LF 170.00 17,000.00 350.00 35,000.00 176.50 17,650.00 138.00 13,800.00
9.[Permit, install and maintain erosion control/SWMMP 1.0 |EA 7,500.00 7,500.00 7,500.00 7,500.00 5,188.15 5,188.15] 23,690.00 23,690.00
10.|Miscellaneous clearing and sitework 1.0 |EA 5,000.00 5,000.00 6,500.00 6,500.00 33,467.80 33,467.80] 93,806.60 93,806.60
11.|Install/open cut 18" RCP(A) storm drain pipe 2,400 [LF 50.00 { 120,000.00 135.00 | 324,000.00 44.65| 107,160.00 65.68 | 157,632.00
12.|Install/open cut 24" RCP(A) storm drain pipe 280 [LF 65.00 18,200.00 165.00 46,200.00 53.70 15,036.00 82.42 23,077.60
13. [Install new catch basin (CB-01 frame/grate) over existing pipe 7 |EA 3,500.00 24,500.00 8,150.00 57,050.00 4,148.95 29,042.65 4,004.30 28,030.10
14.|Install new catch basin (CB-01 frame/grate) in-line with new storm drain pipes 3 |EA 3,500.00 10,500.00 7,500.00 22,500.00 3,496.80 10,490.40 3,240.13 9,720.39
15.|Construct Type I ditch 270 |LF 10.00 2,700.00 25.00 6,750.00 4.75 1,282.50 5.75 1,552.50
16.|Haul-in/grade linestone (Type 610) 40 |TN 40.00 1,600.00 145.00 5,800.00 71.85 2,874.00 57.50 2,300.00
17.|Install slab sod at catch basins 1 |EA 7,000.00 7,000.00 750.00 750.00 4,117.05 $4,117.05 6,900.00 6,900.00

BASE BID [ltem "1.-17."]:

$469,750.00

$844,462.50

$441,618.50

$577,785.69

Notes to Bid Opening:

(1) A& A Cable Contractors Inc. - extension for Bid Item 2 was incorrect.

Certified Correct; / %ﬁ 2 % & L"\&t;.

Klle/F Bates, P. E.

30-Oct-14

Date




Bid Opening: Thursday, October 30, 2014, 10:00 a.m,

BID TABULATION
HAMMOND NORTHSHORE REGIONAL AIRPORT PHASE II DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS FOR THE CITY OF HAMMOND

Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC, Consulting Civil Engineers

Kort's Construction Lawson-Bonet Richard Price
Bid Services, Inc. Construction, Inc. Contracting Co., LLC Stranco, LLC
Item Description Bid Quantity| Unit Price | Extension | Unit Price | Extension | UnitPrice | Extension | UnitPrice | Extension
1.|Mobilization 1 |EA $25,000.00] $25,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00] $60,000.00] $60,000.00] $ 36,000.00 | $36,000.00
2.|Haul-in/compact earthen backfill - vehicular measure 250 |CY 14.00 3,500.00 12.00 3,000.00 24.00 6,000.00 12.00 3,000.00
3.|Install flowable fill in pipe voids as directed (truck measure) 250 |CY 90.00 22,500.00 140.00 35,000.00 150.00 37,500.00 140.00 35,000.00
4.[Pipe Cleaning (24" - 36" diameter storm drain pipes) 1,200 [LF 5.00 6,000.00 20.00 24,000.00 11.00 13,200.00 5.50 6,600.00
5.|Clean/access existing catch basin 2 |EA 250.00 500.00 250.00 500.00 260.00 520.00 125.00 250.00
6.|{Post CIPP Video storm drain pipes (all sizes) 1,200 |LF 1.00 1,200.00 12.00 14,400.00 5.15 6,180.00 1.10 1,320.00
7.|Install CIPP Lining (existing 24" pipe) 1,100 |LF 95.00] 104,500.00 130.00{ 143,000.00 256.00f 281,600.00 105.00 | 115,500.00
8. |Install CIPP Lining (existing 30" pipe) 100 [LF 120.00 12,000.00 150.00 15,000.00 274.00 27,400.00 135.00 13,500.00
9.|Permit, install and maintain erosion control/SWMMP 1.0 [EA 10,000.00 10,000.00 12,000.00 12,000.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
10. |Miscellaneous clearing and sitework 1.0 |EA 32,200.00 32,200.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.001 17,500.00 17,500.00
11.|Install/open cut 18" RCP(A) storm drain pipe 2,400 |LF 45.00| 108,000.00 48.00{ 115,200.00 68.00| 163,200.00 80.00 192,000.00
12. {Install/open cut 24" RCP(A) storm drain pipe 280 |LF 52.00 14,560.00 55.00 15,400.00 80.00 22,400.00 100.00 28,000.00
13.{Install new catch basin (CB-01 frame/grate) over existing pipe 7 |EA 3,500.00 24,500.00 3,200.00 22,400.00 4,000.00 28,000.00 4,500.00 31,500.00
14, |Install new catch basin (CB-01 frame/grate) in-line with new storm drain pipes 3 |EA 3,500.00 10,500.00 3,200.00 9,600.00 3,500.00 10,500.00 3,000.00 9,000.00
15.|Construct Type I ditch 270 |LF 22.00 5,940.00 10.00 2,700.00 25.00 6,750.00 10.00 2,700.00
16. |Haul-in/grade linestone (Type 610) 40 |TN 40.00 1,600.00 50.00 2,000.00 130.00 5,200.00 50.00 2,000.00
17. |Install slab sod at catch basins 1 [EA 4,000.00 4,000.00 7,000.00 7,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00] 10,000.00 10,000.00
BASE BID [item "1.-17."]: $386,500.00 $434,700.00 $695,950.00 $508,870.00

Notes to Bid Opening:

Certified Correct:

(1) A & A Cable Contractors, Inc. - extension for Bid ltem 2 was incorrect.

KA 7=

Kiley F/i Bates

30-Oct-14

Date




