BID SUMMARY

Sidewalk & Drainage Improvements [FY 2015]
for the City of Hammond

Bid Opening: Thursday, April 2, 2015, 10 a.m.

Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC

La. Contr. BASE BID Add. Alt. No. 1 Bid
BIDDER License No. items "1." - "44." NET BID Rank
1. Jay Bearden Construction, Inc. [d] $ 195,828.40
P. O. Box 180428; Richland, MS 39218 55217 ¥ 1,605434.00 $ 1,801,262.40 [7]
2. Beverly Industrlgs, LLC 35678 NO BID $ -
P. O. Box 9016; Bridge City, LA 70096
3. Command Construction, LLC [c] $ 216,110.00
40038 .
3206 N. Turnbull Dr.; Metairie, LA 70002 $ 1,509,870.00 $ 1,725,980.00 [6]
4. Durr.Heavy Construction, LLC 4674 NO BID $ -
817 Hickory Ave.; Harahan, LA 70123
5. Hardrock Construction, LL.C $ 185,890.00
0 .
2305 L & A Road; Metairie, LA 70001 24901 $ 1,254,980.00 $ 1,440,870.00 [2]
6. Industrial Enterprises, Inc. $ 193,594.01
P. O. Box 15414; Baton Rouge, LA 70895 5693 $  1,478,109.86 $ 1,671,703.87 [5]
7. KCR Contractors, LLC [a] [b] $ 115,673.40
44617 S. Airport Rd. (Ste A); Hammond 70401 37931 $  1,284,300.00 $ 1,399,973.40 [4]
8. L. King Company $ -
2450 Florida Ave.SW (Ste B); D.S., LA 70726 42360 NO BID
9. Kort's Construction Services, Inc. $ 143,385.00
49356 .
2182 Manton Drive; Covington, LA 70433 ? $ 1,255,625.00 $ 1,399,010.00 [3]
10. Lawson-Bonet Construction, Inc. 39990 NO BID $ -
P. O. Box 1313; Hammond, LA 70404
11. Richard Price Contracting Co, LLC [e] $ 215,730.00
0 .
25509 Walker South Rd.; D.S., LA 70726 14807 | $  1,652,315.00 $ 1,868,045.00 (8]
12. Stranco, Inc. $ 144,036.50
16724 .
70459 Hwy. 59; Abita Springs, LA 70420 $  1,208,395.50 $ 1,352,432.00 [1]
13. Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc. 12198 NO BID $ -
24288 Hwy. 190; Robert, LA 70455
NOTES TO BID OPENING:
[a] No unit prices entered for bid items "17.", "18", "19" - recommend rejecting bid
[b] Unit prices entered for "Add. Alt. No. 1" do not agree with unit prices entered for "Base Bid"
[c] Unit prices entered for "Add. Alt. No. 1" do not agree with unit prices entered for "Base Bid"
[d] Unit prices entered for "Add. Alt. No. 1" do not agree with unit prices entered for "Base Bid"
[e] Error in extension of 3 bid items in "Add. Alt. No. 1"
Certified Correct: %M&A 2-Apr-2015
T. C. Spanglet, Jr, P.E. DATE
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