Spangler Engineering, LL.C

CONSULTING CIVIL ENGINEERS T. C. Spangler, Jr., P.E.
Webb M. Anderson, P.E.
Jay C. Pittman, P.E.

November 11, 2019

Honorable Pete Panepinto, Mayor
and City Council
City of Hammond
P. O. Box 2788
Hammond, LA 70404
RE: M. L. King Park PARKING IMPROVEMENTS

Project # 420-12108
Gentlemen & Madame:

We have reviewed bids received Friday, November 8, 2019, on above-referenced project
and offer the following recommendations:

“Contract A — ASPHALT”: Award to the low bidder, RWB Contracting, LLC, for the
base bid in the amount of $172,567.00.

“Contract B— CONCRETE": Subject to a $113,000 supplemental appropriation, award
to the low bidder, M & O Construction, LLC, for the base bid amount of $247,440.00.

The concrete option is preferable from a longevity standpoint; however, concrete is
initially more costly.

Bid Tabulation, Bid Summary, and Budgets for both “Contract A — ASPHALT” and
“Contract B— CONCRETE?” are attached.

[f there are any comments or questions, please advise. I will be present at the 11/12/2019
council meeting..

Sincerely,

T. C. Spangfér, Jr., P.E.
Attachments

cc: Mr. Robert Morgan
Ms. Syeda Naeem

214 Southwest Railroad Avenue « Post Office Box 1374 « Hammond, Louisiana 70404 « (985) 542-8665



BID SUMMARY

Contract A - ASPHALT
M. L. King Park PARKING IMPROVEMENTS

for the City of Hammond
Bid Opening: Friday, Nov. 8, 2019, 10:00 a.m. Engineer: Spangler Engineering,LLC
La. Contr. BASE BID Bid
BIDDER License No.[ items"A1."-"A14." Rank

1. Barriere Construction Co., LLC
407 CC Road; Franklinton, LA 70438
2. Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc.
24288 Hwy. 190; Robert, LA 70455
3. Gulf States Services, LLC (A)
101 Production Dr. (Suite D); Slidell, LA 70460
4. Industrial Enterprises, Inc.
P.O. Box 15414; Baton Rouge, LA 70895
5. JAC Construction of S. LA, llc (B)

6276 NO BID

12198 NO BID

68237 REJECTED

5693 | $ 181,874.00 [2]

39116 Live Oak Rd.; Franklinton, LA 70438 58607 NO BID
6. Kort's Construction Services, Inc,

2182 Manton Dr.; Covington, LA 70433 49356 NO BID
7. Magee Excavation & Development, LLC 54896 NO BID

21664 Hwy. 40; Bush, LA 70431
8. M & O Construction, LLC (C)
811-B Mooney Dr.; Hammond, LA 70403
9. RWB Contracting, LLC
22369 Hwy. 440; Kentwood, LA 70444
10. Richard Price Contracting Co., LLC
25509 Walker South Rd.; Denham Springs, LA 70726
11. Stranco, LLC
70459 Hwy. 59; Abita Springs, LA 70420
12. Warner Trucking, Inc.
67393 Z. McDaniel Rd.; Franklinton, LA 70438

47666 | $ 208,980.00 [5]

59966 | $ 172,567.00 [1]

14807 | $ 199.610.00 [4]

16724 NO BID

60826 | $ 196,788.00 [3]

NOTES TO BID OPENING:
(A) Page "0410-1" excluded from bid submitted:; partial bid submittal returned to bidder
(B) Bid arrived after 10:00 am; returned to bidder unopened
(C) _Error in extension of item "A6.": 320SY x $110.00/SY = $35,200.00 ACTUAL vs. "$6,600.00" written.
Error in extension of item "A12.": 2EA x $7,500.00/EA = $15,000.00 ACTUAL vs. "$22,500.00" written.

Certified Correct; 8-Nov-2019
T C. gpang].’ex’, Jr.f’rP.E. Date
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BID SUMMARY

Contract B - CONCRETE
M. L. King Park PARKING IMPROVEMENTS
for the City of Hammond

Bid Opening: Friday, Nov. 8, 2019, 10:00 a.m.

Engineer: Spangler Engineering,LLC
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NOTES TO BID OPENING:

(D) Page "0410-1" excluded from bid submitted; partial bid submittal returned to bidder

(E) Bid arrived after 10:00 am; returned to bidder unopened

(F) Error in extension of item "B6.": 2,800SY x $49.50/SY = $138,600.00 actual vs. "$137,250.00" written.

Revised Bid total = $247,440.00 actual vs. "$246,090.00" written.

Certified Correct: _%M%
T. C. Spahgler 3., P.I.
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